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ASTRID 24 CHANDELIER

ARCHIVE COLLECTION
From the Remains Archive. From the Remains
Archive. The Astrid 24 chandelier by Remains
Lighting is a large 24 light solid brass chandelier
having three tiers of four over eight over twelve
arms arrayed on a baluster-form stem. Subtle linear
details are incised on the central ball, baluster, and
urn-form elements found in the main body, as well as
on the cups, bobeches and finials. Our Archive
Collection consists of the best examples of previous
custom projects & historic fixtures from our
collection. They are made available as inspiration for
recreation or inclusion in custom projects. Our
Archive Collection consists of the best examples of
previous custom projects & historic fixtures from our
collection. They are made available as inspiration for
recreation or inclusion in custom projects.

DIMENSIONS
Minimum height: 61-1/4"
Overall: 43-1/2" diameter

APPLICATION
UL listed for use in dry environments

LAMPING
24 Candelabra sockets, maximum 25 watts per
socket

JUNCTION BOX
Heavy duty ceiling junction box required

OPTIONS
Contact us to learn about pricing, lead time, and
customization options.

HL1293.24

AVAILABLE FINISHES
$19775 Polished Brass

$21550 Burnished Brass, Burnished Nickel, Dark
Waxed Bronze, Polished Nickel

$22615 Antique Brass, Dark Pewter, German Silver,
Light Pewter, Oil Rubbed Bronze, Satin
Nickel


